
UPLOWMAN PARISH COUNCIL

Clerk to the Council : Robert Hodgson
Lower Beer,
Uplowman,

Tiverton EX16 7PF
Tel/fax: 01884-821239

E-mail : UplowmanPC@btconnect.com

09/05/18
All Parish Councillors

Dear Councillors,

UPLOWMAN PARISH COUNCIL - NOTICE OF  ANNUAL MEETING
THURSDAY 17th May 2018, starting at 7.30pm in Uplowman Village Hall

The next meeting of this Council will be on THURSDAY 17th May 2018, starting at 7.30pm 
in Uplowman Village Hall with any comments from the public. Draft Minutes of the last meeting have 
been circulated and can be found at https://  parish  .middevon.gov.uk/  Uplowman  .

Items of particular note on the Agenda:  
 

• Update on the Parish Planning process (second meeting minutes attached);
• Approval of governance and finace statements.  Agreement to claim exemption from external 

Audit (see attached documents to be completed at the meeting).
• New General Data Protection Regulations will come into force on May 25 th.  A data protection 

officer is not needed, after a change in the regulations.  However, we must draw up an agreed 
set of procedures for managing data that ensures that any data we hold is used in compliance  
with the Regulations.  

• Sampford Peverell & Uplowman Parish Magazine have a surplus of funds and have offered 
£420 towards projects in Uplowman.  Your suggestions welcomed.

The following dates have been booked for meetings in 2018: (all Thursdays): 19 th July, 20th 

September and 15th November. 

Yours sincerely,

Robert Hodgson (Clerk to Uplowman Parish Council)

https://parish.middevon.gov.uk/Uplowman
https://parish.middevon.gov.uk/Uplowman
https://parish.middevon.gov.uk/Uplowman
https://parish.middevon.gov.uk/Uplowman


UPLOWMAN PARISH COUNCIL
AGENDA FOR ANNUAL MEETING TO BE HELD AT THE VILLAGE HALL, 

UPLOWMAN, ON THURSDAY 17th MAY 2018 at 7.30pm
The evening will start with an open session at which a report on the past year will be presented and parishioners may raise 
matters of concern. All are welcome to observe the council meeting.

1.  Attendance
1.1 Election of Chair for the coming year, 2018-9

2.  Procedural matters, including reports from DCC and MDDC:
2.1    Apologies for Absence

3. Minutes of last meeting (15th  March 2018)

4. Matters arising from Minutes of  last meeting not covered elsewhere

5. Finance and procedures
5.1 Current position : 

Bank balance at last meeting : £4,177.92

Income since last meeting (Precept less DALC sub) £2,822.73

Expenditure authorised on  15 Mar: £632.90

Current balance: £6,367.75

5.2 Payments for approval:
R Hodgson, Clerk's  expenses  (£9.15)
WJ Veen, grass cutting (£91.75)
Community First Trading, Insurance premium (£192.01)

5.3 Review Governance statements
5.4 Review and approve Financial Statements and approve self-certfication of audit exemption.
5.5 General Data Protection Regulations: DPO not required. Review of communications needed.
5.6 Clerk’s salary for 2018-9

6. Planning and Licensing Applications (plus applications received after this notice) : 
6.1 18/00041/OUT: 8 dwellings in Crosses Fm Field.  Opposed by UPC, refused by MDDC
6.2 17/00033/OUT: 8 dwellings, Crosses Fm Field.  Appeal dismissed
6.4  Locks Fm, covered yard.  Permitted by MDDC
6.6 18/00283/OUT: Jaspers Green, single dwelling.  UPC asked it to be called in.  Planning Cttee on 16th
6.7 18/00250/HOUSE: Connemara, erect extension. UPC had no objection, permitted by MDDC

7. Parish Planning
7.1 Update on progress  of group, and proposals for taking forward.  Meeting on 18 May.

8. Correspondence (See attached list plus any correspondence received after this notice)
8.1 Environment, SWW, etc:   
8.2 Local Plans and Surveys, Including Foot Path Definitive Map Review
8.3 General Correspondence
8.5 Village projects

9. Hall & Recreation Association
9.1 Report.

10. Emergency Planning & Neighbourhood Watch
10.1 Neighbourhood Watch Report

11. Community Projects and matters.
11.1 School parking update
11.2 £420 available for projects in Uplowman from SP&U Parish Mag.
11.3 TAP fund open again

12. Parish Transport/Paths.
12.1 Definitive Map Review: Consultation until Sept 21.  Proposal to divert Footpath 11 at Wood Farm

13. Date of next meeting (Thursday 19 July 2018, to be confirmed).



CORRESPONDENCE SINCE LAST MEETING (15 Mar 2018)
Ser No Date received From/to Subject Date replied/sent

457 07/04/18 Nat West Statement: Balance = £3595.02

458 07/04/18 DALC Invoice for subscription (£77.26) 14/04/18

459 07/04/18 MDDC Remittance advice for payment of Precept (£2822.73)

460 12/04/18 HMRC Changes to system for reclaiming VAT

461 04/05/18 Community First Insurance reneway: £192.01

6.  PLANNING

Ser No Date received From/to Subject Date 
replied/sent

626 19/03/18 MDDC 18/00041/OUT: 8 dwellings in Crosses Fm Field - refused

627 MDDC 18/00283/OUT: Jaspers Green, single dwelling: Call in 19/03/18

628 MDDC 18/00250/HOUSE: Connemara, extension. UPC no obj 19/03/18

629 13/04/18 MDDC 18/00250/House: Connemara extension: permitted

630 13/04/18 MDDC 18/00396/PNAG: Court Fm, Erect Ag Bldg, permitted

631 08/05/18 MDDC 17/00033/OUT:8 dwellings in Crosses Fm Field, Appeal dismiss

7.1 ENVIRONMENT, including Sewerage, Recycling, Roads & rivers

Ser No Date received From/to Subject Date replied/sent

321 Nothing this time

7.2 LOCAL PLANS & SURVEYS, including HRA

Ser No Date received From/to Subject Date replied/sent

311 16/04/18 DCC Definitive Map Review consultation until 15 Sept

312 27/04/18 DCC Proposed diversion of FP No 11 at Wood Fm, comments by 31/05

7.3   GENERAL CORRESPONDENCE

Ser No Date received From/to Subject Date replied/sent

1572 16/04/18 HealthwatchVoices magazine

1573 30/04/18 The shed man Suppliers of bus shelters

1574 08/05/18 C&CD Clerks & Councils Direct

1575 11/05/18 HAGS Play equipment

7.5 Village projects. 

Ser No Date received From/to Subject Date replied/sent

333 Nothing this time

Plus about 310  incoming emails. Support for councillors: http://www.ntselearning.co.uk for information and on-line courses.

http://www.ntselearning.co.uk/









